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Editorial policy 

The journal welcomes submissions in any of the areas of plasma physics. Its scope includes experimental 
and theoretical work on basic plasma physics, the plasma physics of magnetic and inertial fusion, laser-
plasma interactions, industrial plasmas, plasma devices and plasmas in space and astrophysics. This list 
is, of course, merely illustrative of the wide range of topics on which papers are invited, and is not 
intended to exclude any aspect of plasma physics which is not explicitly mentioned. 
 
Authors are urged to ensure that their papers are written clearly and attractively, in order that their work 
will be readily accessible to readers. Manuscripts must be written in English. Journal of Plasma Physics 
employs a rigorous peer-review process whereby all submitted manuscripts are sent to recognized experts 
in their subjects for evaluation. The Editor’s decision on the suitability of a manuscript for publication is 
final. 

Submission of manuscripts 

Papers may be submitted to the Editor or to any of the Associate Editors. Three copies should be sent 
accompanied by the author's address, telephone and fax number, and if possible, an electronic mailing 
address. Submission of a paper is taken to imply that it has not been previously published and that it is not 
being considered for publication elsewhere. Upon acceptance of a paper, the author will be asked to 
transfer copyright to the publisher. 
 
The publisher encourages submission of manuscripts written in LaTeX for which a JPP style file can be 
obtained using anonymous FTP from the internet address ftp.cup.cam.ac.uk. Go into the directory 
/pub/texarchive/journals/latex/ where you will find a concatenated file called jpp.all. This contains 
readme.txt, jpp.sty and jppguide.tex. If you Tex jppguide.tex you will get a full set 
of instructions for using the style file. In case of difficulties obtaining these files, there is a help-line 
available via e-mail; please contact texline@cup.cam.ac.uk. The publisher may also be able to typeset 
papers submitted on disc in ordinary LaTeX or plain TeX using 'article style'.  
 
When submitting the final manuscript ready for publishing, authors may send an email attachment of the 
file. This should be the TeX source code file with any additional files used. Do not attempt to send the 
TeX in the body of an email message. The file should be named: JPPauthor surname.tex. Any artwork 
files should be sent as .eps format and should be named JPPauthor surname1 (where the number is the 
figure number).  Hardcopies, including all artwork are sent to the Editor as normal, BUT all electronic 
files are to be sent to a central email address: lchatterton@cambridge.org. The publisher reserves the right 
to typeset any article by conventional means if the author's TeX code presents problems in production. 

Layout of manuscripts 

Papers should be typewritten using double spacing throughout, on one side of the paper, allowing 
generous margins on all sides of the paper. Papers should begin with an abstract of not more than 300 
words and should end with a brief concluding section.  
 



Illustrations 

Figures should be drawn in black ink on white paper or produced from a high-quality laser printer. Figure 
captions should be supplied separately from the figures themselves. Colour illustrations can be accepted, 
but will be subject to a charge that will be notified to authors on acceptance of their paper. Authors who 
are not able to pay the charges for colour figures, and whose figures will be printed in black and white in 
the Journal, should include a URL in the caption to affected figures to direct readers to a website where 
figures can be viewed in colour. 

References 

These should follow either the Harvard (name/date) or Vancouver (numbered) system. In the Harvard 
system, each reference should be cited in the text as ‘author(s) (date)’ or ‘(author(s) date)’, and the 
reference list at the end of the paper should be in alphabetical order. In the Vancouver system, references 
should be indicated in the text by numbers in square brackets (e.g. [1], [1,2], [1-4], etc.), and should be 
listed at the end of the paper in numerical order of citation. For details of the style of entries within the 
reference list, please see any recent issue of the journal. 

Proof Reading 

Only typographical or factual errors may be changed at proof stage. The publisher reserves the right to 
charge authors for correction of non-typographical errors. No page charge is made. 

Offprints 

50 offprints of each article will be supplied free to each first named author. Extra offprints may be 
purchased from the publisher if ordered at proof stage.  
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